
R-9-18 

City Emblems – Prohibited Uses - Fine 

Rules and City Government Committee Proposed Amendments 

 

Amendment #1  

Page 1, line 34 in the Table column for “Fine for Initial Offense” strike “$500.00” insert 

“$50.00”; in the Table column for “Fine for Repeat or continuous Violations” strike “$500.00” 

insert “$100.00” 

 


